1~ PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

Madison County Board of Supervisors
146 West Center Street / Post Office Box 608
Canton, MS 39046
Office (601)-855~5534 ~ Fax (601) 859-5875

August 5, 2024
To: Board of Supervisors
From: Kesha Jackson, Purchasing Clerk
Subject: Consideration of Declaration of Sole Source

The Madison County Road Department has requisitioned for Deviney Rental & Supply to
replace the Def Header and tank assembly for a Kubota Tractor. As the attached letter,
indicates that Deviney Rental & Supply is the sole source of Kubota equipment and only
authorized license dealer locally.

I recommend that the board declare this as a Sole Source, authorize the issuance of a purchase

order to Deviney Rental & Supply for $5,279.46 to replace the Def Header and tank assembly
per the attached quote.

Thank you in advance for your consideration of the above recommendations.



P.O. Box 1872

,' Madison, MS 39130
Phone (601)859-0020
Fax (601)407-1988

Visit us at:
RENTAL & SUPPLY www.devineyrental.com

SOLD TO SHIP TO
MADOO3 MADISON CO ROAD DEPT MCRD
3137 SOUTH LIBERTY
CANTON, MS 39046

ROBERT

Tax D Qty Description Price

COMMENT :

_INSPECTED MACHIN

~TRACTOR NEEDS A NEW DEF HEADER.
.REF TO . W01612

‘PARTS TO SHOP ' o '
NoEE TR KB 3N800~05106 . - TANK,ASSY (D 4475.27 4475.27

SHOP SUPPLIES

- N— —_— , - ‘ PR35 20
,CUSTOMER LABOR -
| - ‘ %% TOTAL CUSTOMER LABOR ' 675.00
FREIGHT & HDLG

N SHIPPING e : 85.99

IRCIoR

Please note lhat any eslimales prov!ded ror farm equmcnl servk:es are only an appfoximauon The actual cost may vary based on several factors, including the condition
of the equipment, the'complexity of the repalrs needed, and the avaliabilty of replacemant parts. As such, any eslimate we provide is sUbject Lo change at any time.

We make every eflert lo provide accurate estimales, but e cannot be held iable for any discrepancies betwaen the eslimate and the aclual cost of service.

By accepting our estimate, you agree lo these terms and acknowledga that any linal costs incurred for services rendered are your responsibility.”

** SUBTOTAL 5279.46

X : Charge Sale

PAY THIS
AMOUNT .

$5279.46




FW: LETTER OF ACKNOWLEDGEMENT (DEVINEY)

Michael Steele <michael.steele@madison-co.com>
Tue 7/16/2024 3:30 PM
To:Helen Keller <helen.keller@madison-co.com>

From: Chuck Floyd <chuckfloyd@deviney.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2024 3:29 PM ‘

To: Michael Steele <michael.steele@madison-co.com>
Cc: Earl Guilbeau <earlguilbeau@deviney.com>

Subject: FW: LETTER OF ACKNOWLEDGEMENT (DEVINEY)

CAUTION! External Content. Please use caution when opening
attachments and links. Do not provide your username and password
if requested.

From: Chuck Floyd ‘

Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2024 10:33 AM

To: Michael. Steele@madison-co.com

Cc: Earl Guilbeau <earlguilbeau@deviney.com>
Subject: LETTER OF ACKNOWLEDGEMENT (DEVINEY)

Michael,

In reference to the repair(s) to tractor M68-111, SN# 51867, ( replacing the
DEF Header & tank assembly) Deviney is the only Kubota licensed
dealer/service department in the immediate area that can complete this
repair due to the nature of the repair and Federal Government regulations.
Let us know if you have any questions.

Thank you,

Chaad Flpe
DEVINEY

Deviney Rental & Supply
Madison, MS. 39110

Ph# (601)-859-0020




